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ITEM 

BATTERIES AND SURGE PROTECTORS 

650 BATTERY BACKUP AND SURGE PROTECTOR 

1350VA BATTERY BACKUP UPS, 10-OUTLETS 

AA ALKALINE BATTERIES 

AAA ALKALINE BATTERIES 

BINDING AND ACCESSORIES 

1" ROUND RING VIEW BINDER WHITE 

HEAVY DUTY 5" 3-RING D-RING VIEW BINDER WHITE 

2" D-RING VIEW BINDER WHITE 

3" D-RING VIEW BINDER WHITE 

1" ROUND RING NON-VIEW BINDER BLACK 

1-1/2" ROUND RING VIEW BINDER WHITE 

2" ROUND RING VIEW BINDER BLACK 

CALCULATORS 

DESKTOP CALCULATOR 8-DIGIT 

12-DIGIT DESKTOP PRINTING CALCULATOR 

CALENDARS AND APPOINTMENT BOOKS 

22"X17" MONTHLY DESK PAD, BLACK 

8"X10" WEEKLY PLANNER, BLACK 

30"X20" MONTHLY WALL CALENDAR 

CASH RECEIPT BOOKS 

CARBONLESS RECEIPT BOOK, 11"X8", 3-PART 

COMPUTER ACCESSORIES 

DUAL MONITOR STAND, UP TO 27" MONITORS, BLACK 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 23" WIDESCREEN MONITOR 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 17" STANDARD MONITOR 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 18.1" STANDARD MONITOR 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 18.5" WIDESCREEN MONITOR 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 19" STANDARD MONITOR 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 19" WIDESCREEN MONITOR 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 20" WIDESCREEN MONITOR 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 20.1" STANDARD MONITOR 

PRIVACY FILTER FOR 20.1" WIDESCREEN MONITOR 

ELECTRONICS DUSTER 10 OZ 

ELECTRONICS DUSTER 7 OZ 

ENVELOPES 

CLASP CATALOG ENVELOPE 9"X12" KRAFT 

EASY-CLOSE PEEL & SEAL #10 ENVELOPES, 4-1/8"X9-1/2" WHITE 

GUMMED #10 ENVELOPE 4-1/8"X9-1/2" WHITE 

SELF-SEALING ENVELOPE 9"X12" KRAFT 

FILING AND ORGANIZATION 

100% RECYCLED HANGING FILE FOLDERS 1/5 CUT LETTER SIZE GREEN 

100% RECYCLED HANGING FILE FOLDERS 1/5 CUT ADJUSTABLE TABS LETTER SIZE GREEN 

100% RECYCLED 5-TAB HANGING FILE FOLDERS LEGAL SIZE GREEN 

100% RECYCLED HANGING FILE FOLDERS 1/5 CUT LEGAL SIZE GREEN 

PREMIUM FOLDER FASTENERS



FILE POCKETS STRAIGHT CUT TAB 3.5" EXPANSION LETTER SIZE REDROPE 

FILE POCKETS STRAIGHT CUT TAB 3.5" EXPANSION LEGAL SIZE REDROPE 

HEAVY DUTY FILE FOLDERS ASSORTED TABS 1/3 CUT LETTER SIZE ASSORTED COLORS 

FILE FOLDERS ASSORTED TABS 1/3 CUT LETTER SIZE ASSORTED COLORS 

FILE FOLDERS ASSORTED TABS 1/3 CUT LEGAL ASSORTED COLORS 

TOP-LOADING SHEET PROTECTORS, CLEAR 2.8 MIL 

GENERAL OFFICE PAPER 

8 1/2 X 11 COPY PAPER 92 BRIGHTNESS 500 SHEETS/RM 

8 1/2 X 14 COPY PAPER 92 BRIGHTNESS 500 SHEETS/RM 

IMAGING AND LAMINATING SUPPLIES, BLANK COMPUTER MEDIA 

94554 52X CD-R 700 MB CAPACITY 

PREMIUM LAMINATING POUCHES 11 1/2" X 9", 5 MIL. LETTER 

16 GB USB 2.0 FLASH DRIVES 

LABELS 

LASER ADDRESS LABELS WHITE 1X2-5/8" 

LASER ADDRESS LABELS WHITE 3-1/3X4" 

PRINTABLE FILE FOLDER LABELS WHITE 2/3X3-7/16" 

RETURN ADDRESS LABELS WHITE 1/2X1-3/4" 

MAILING AND SHIPPING 

WHITE MAILING TUBES 3"X36" 

MISC. SUPPLIES 

HAND SANITIZER, PUMP, 10 OZ 

WIRE MESH PENCIL AND PEN CUP HOLDER, BLACK 

FLAT BOX FACIAL TISSUE, 2-PLY 

DISINFECTING WIPES 

PAPER TOWELS, ROLL, 2-PLY 

COUNTERFEIT PEN 

PLASTIC KNIVES, HEAVY WEIGHT 

PLASTIC FORKS, HEAVY WEIGHT 

PLASTIC SPOONS, HEAVY WEIGHT 

PAPER PLATES, 9" 

PAPER HOT CUP, 12 OZ. 

PLASTIC HOT CUP LID, 10-20 OZ. 

GROUND COFFEE, MEDIUM ROAST, CAFFEINATED 

GROUND COFFEE, MEDIUM ROAST, DECAFFEINATED 

K-CUP COMPATIBLE COFFEE PODS, MEDIUM ROAST, CAFFEINATED 

K-CUP COMPATIBLE COFFEE PODS, MEDIUM ROAST, DECAFFEINATED 

COFFEE STIRRERS 

SUGAR PACKETS 

STEVIA PACKETS 

PRE-MEASURED COFFEE PACK, 0.8 OZ, CAFFEINATED 

NOTEPADS 

STENO PADS, 6"X9" GREGG RULED WHITE 

LEGAL PAD, 8-1/2"X11" WIDE RULED 

OFFICE CLIPS 

STEEL BINDER CLIPS MEDIUM 5/8" CAPACITY 

STEEL BINDER CLIPS LARGE 2" CLIP, 1" CAPACITY



STEEL BINDER CLIPS SMALL, 3/8" CAPACITY 

STEEL BINDER CLIPS MINI, 1/4" CAPACITY 

SELF-STICK NOTES 

SELF STICK NOTES 3"X3" 

SELF STICK NOTES 1 1/2" X 2" 

SELF STICK NOTES 4"X6" LINED 

SELF STICK FLAT NOTES 1 3/8" X 1 7/8" 

SIGN HERE FLAGS 1" WIDE 

RULED BOOKS AND INDEX CARDS 

5"X8" LINE RULED WHITE INDEX CARDS 

4"X6" INDEX CARDS RULED WHITE 

STAMPS 

5-IN-1 DATE STAMP SELF-INKING 

U.S. STAMP & SIGN RUBBER DATE STAMP, 4 BANDS, 10 YEARS, TYPE SIZE 1 1/2 

STAPLES, TAPE, AND SUPPLIES 

STANDARD STAPLES 1/4" 

HIGH CAPACITY STAPLES 3/8" 

INVISIBLE TAPE, MATTE FINISH 3/4"X36 YARDS 

WHITE-OUT 10-PACK CORRECTION TAPE, SIDEWINDER 

WRITING INSTRUMENTS 

RETRACTABLE GEL PENS, FINE POINT, BLACK INK 

BALLPOINT STICK PENS, MEDIUM POINT, BLACK 

ROLLERBALL PENS, FINE POINT, BLUE 

BALLPOINT STICK PENS, MEDIUM POINT, BLACK 

BALLPOINT STICK PENS MEDIUM POINT BLUE 

GRIP GEL STICK PENS MEDIUM POINT BLACK 

ROLLERBALL PENS, FINE POINT, RED 

TANK STYLE HIGHLIGHTERS, CHISEL TIP, FLUORESCENT YELLOW 

TANK STYLE HIGHLIGHTERS, CHISEL TIP, ASSORTED 

PEN STYLE HIGHLIGHTERS, CHISEL TIP, ASSORTED



QUILL PRICE PER ITEM OD PRICE PER ITEM 

50.34 

NO BID 

61.8 

67.96 

3.6 

016 = 0.07 
0.048 

0.03 

0.13 NO BID 

0.23 

0.22 

0.26 

0.28 NO BID 

0.081 NO BID 

79.99 

OE PRICE PER ITEM AE PRICE PER ITEM 

74.68 

212.79 

1.05 

1.07 

1.54 

11.79 

2.99 

3.59 

1.52 

2.26 

2.77 

5.32 

72.05 

2.1 

17.07 

13.98 

7.39 

105.99 

107.3 

135.4900 DAT 

76.99 

155.39 

118.99 

174.29 

182.69 

174.29 

4.11 

4.11 

0.19 

83.74 

53.54 

53.54 

54.99 

60.16 

4.4 

4.36 

0.08 

0.24 

163.54 

240.55 

1.51 

1.51 

1.3 

9.73 

2.31 

2.87 

1.27 

1.66 

1.98 

175.8 

37.94 

0.27 NO BID 

NO BID 

0.91 

0.1



2.6 0.93 1.67 

NO BID 1.21 1.92 

0.15 NO BID 

NO BID 0.27 NO BID 

0.05 009 0.04 0.07 

35 2.99 3.1 3 
6.39 NO BID 49 3.7 

0.15 025 = 012 0.24 
0.25 0.51 0.18 

5.35 4.93 5.98 

0.002 0.007 0.003 0.001 
NO BID 0.01 0.007 
NO BID 0.02 0.02 
NO BID 0,001 0.001 

NO BID 4.1 6.34 

1.83 5.99 
0.82 0.97 0.79 

0.65 
3.66 3.99 

0.63 NO BID 0.72 
0.42 1.24 2.61 
0.03 0.03 0.04 
0.03 0.28 0.04 

0.02 0.03 0.03 
0.1 0.15 0.11 

0.05 0.05 0.07 
0.42/02 

0.34/02 1.82/02 
0.53 0.6 0.54 

0.38 NO BID 0.57 
0.002 0.002 
0.009 0.01 

0.1 
0.64 

1.47 
0.48 

0.05 



0.02 0.02 0.03 

0.21 0.31 

0.11 0.13 

0.67 1.19 

NO BID NO BID 

0.02 
0.01 

15.11 
6.36 795 4,99 31.79 

0.0005 = 0.0001 0.0009 
NO BID 0.002 0.001 

NO BID NO BID 
2.52 0.78 

0.76 1.46 0.95 
0.08 NO BID 0.07 

NO BID 0.98 
0.09 0.08 0.07 
0.09 NO BID 0.07 

0.58 0.3 0.26 
1.5 0.98 0.43 

0.21 0.31 0.34 
0.21 0.42 0.38 
0.51 0.37 0.34



QUILL ITEM # 

2259351APC 

24323530APC 

MN1500B4Z DURACELL 

MN2400B4Z DURACELL 

7221WE QUILL 

74205WE QUILL 

7320213 QUILL 

7320313 QUILL 

739301 QUILL 

72215WE QUILL 

7222BK QUILL 

LS82Z CANON 

919333 VICTOR 

QDM90MW20 QUILL 

QSW103MW20 

QCM301MW20 

TC1182 ADAMS 

20937551C1 MOUNT-IT 

PF203W9 3M 

PF170 3M 

PF181 3M 

PF185W9 3M 

PF190 3M 

PF19SW 3M 

PF200W9 3M 

PF201 3M 

PF201W 3M 

718862 

5007526C 

7CL91228 QUILL 

75746Q QUALITY PARK 

WW210ES QUILL 

2708508 QUALITY PARK 

7Q5215 QUILL 

745215 QUILL 

7Q5315 QUILL 

745315 QUILL 

70011 ACCO 

EA 

4 PACK 

6 PACK 

100 BOX 

500 BOX 

500 BOX 

100 BOX 

25 BOX 

50 BOX 

25 BOX 

50 BOX 

100 BOX 

UM UNIT PRICE 

54.84 

168.74 

3.28 

3.33 

1.06 

8.08 

1.73 

2.11 

1.17 

1.13 

1.54 

5.6 

58.46 

NOTES



3MD73224UNI SMEAD 

74224 SMEAD 

75000AD QUILL 

740913AD QUILL 

741013AD QUILL 

728200 QUILL 

720222CT QUILL 

720223 QUILL 

479609 VERBATIM 

11020Q QUILL 

DSP16GB10PK CENTON 

710786B QUILL 

710788 QUILL 

731105Q QUILL 

710796 QUILL 

558448STP 

7QB10SAN QUILL 

25283Q QUILL 

7TF830 QUILL 

01594 CLOROX 

7HH290CT QUILL 

1843007 STAPLES 

24390997 PERK 

24390990 PERK 

24390992 PERK 

721666 PERK 

98920Q DIXIE 

91908 DIXIE 

2802493 FOLGERS 

80273 

2646682 DUNKIN DNTS 

802254 MELLITA 

878302 BERKLEY SQ 

72101 N'‘JOY 

50208 STEVIA 

FOLO6897UNI FOLGERS 

SBNW QUILL 

742328 QUILL 

720500 QUILL 

721000 QUILL 

25 BOX 

25 BOX 

50 BOX 

100 BOX 

100 BOX 

200 BOX 

1 CASE 

1 REAM 

100 PACK 

100 BOX 

10 PACK 

7500 BOX 

600 BOX 

1500 BOX 

8000 BOX 

12 CTN 

EA 

EA 

100 BOX 

35 CT 

30 RL/CT 

EA 

100 BOX 

100 BOX 

1000 BOX 

100 PACK 

500 CS 

50 PACK 

96 CTN 

18 BOX 

1000 PACK 

2000 BOX 

200 BOX 

42 CS 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 BOX 

12 BOX 

19.01 

28.65 

7.58 

13.22 

18.85 

10.18 

34.99 10 RMS/CASE 

6.39 

15.23 

74 

53.45 

13.61 

3.8 

3.45 

7.24 

24.48 

1.79 

0.82 

0.67 

2.99 

18.94 

0.42 

2.66 

2.68 

14.24 

2.03 

50.73 

2.28 

12.53 48 OZ 

10.31 30.5 OZ 

37.5 

6.92 

2.35 

18.49 

12.86 

21.69 

9.65 

7.1 

0.59 

1.35 MIN ORDER 3



720200 QUILL 

720100 QUILL 

7384YW QUILL 

7382YW QUILL 

7390YW QUILL 

NO BID 

7QFLISH QUILL 

51Q OXFORD 

41QQ OXFORD 

4422Q STAMP EVER 

2706195 QWIKMARK 

791123 QUILL 

12025QL QUILL 

NO BID 

718673QL10 QUILL 

G27BK PILOT 

29250QL QUILL 

732127 QUILL 

50730QL QUILL 

50731QL QUILL 

711246BK QUILL 

732185 QUILL 

728151 QUILL 

728155 QUILL 

710398 QUILL 

12 BOX 

12 BOX 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

100 PACK 

100 PACK 

100 PACK 

EA 

EA 

5000 BOX 

3000 BOX 

2 PACK 

12 DZ 

60 PACK 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

6 PACK 

0.21 

0.14 

2.52 

1.33 

8.08 

2.85 

1.17 

0.84 

7.97 

6.36 

0.62 

1.51 

5.04 

9.12 

5.03 

4.3 

1.09 

1.03 

2.13 

4.3 

2.31 

2.32 

1.03



QUILL PRICE PER ITEM 

54.84 

168.74 

0.82 

0.83 

1.06 

8.08 

1.73 

2.11 

1.17 

1.13 

1.54 

5.6 

58.46 

OD ITEM # 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

321880 

343749 

343772 

396291 

486328 

486368 

471844 

396251 

396231 

853197 

655646 

162354 

195387 

574928 

415743 

141848 

697395 

417305 

417350 

417305 

110284 

110284 

330808 

633904 

633888 

810994 

810994 

811018 

QTY UM 

EA 

4 PACK 

4 PACK 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

6 PACK 

6 PACK 

100 BOX 

500 BOX 

500 BOX 

25 BOX 

25 BOX 

25 PACK 

UNIT PRICE NOTES 

79.99 

3.11 

6.07 

1.46 

3.23 

5.97 

5.97 

2.05 

2.64 

7.13 

7.13 

3.19 

92.64 

135.49 

76.99 

155.39 

118.99 

174.29 

182.69 

174.29 

24.64 

24.64 

6.76 

15.34 

8.03 

4.7 

4.7 

6.37



0.76 

1.15 

0.15 

0.13 

0.19 

0.05 

3.5 

6.39 

0.15 

0.07 

5.35 

0.0018 

0.006 

0.002 

0.0009 

2.04 

1.79 

0.82 

0.007 

2.99 

0.63 

0.42 

0.03 

0.03 

0.01 

0.02 

0.1 

0.05 

0.26/02 

0.34/02 

0.39 

0.38 

0.002 

0.009 

0.06 

0.52 

0.8 

0.59 

0.049 

0.11 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

917290 

7881526 

491694 

273646 

314264 

761135 

829550 

612111 

734082 

346437 

579207 

733753 

424456 

321388 

321289 

321163 

508359 

673085 

546444 

993562 

765737 

700724 

8/6894 

471565 

683084 

533400 

305466 

429431 

308957 

25 PACK 

100 BOX 

200 PACK 

1 CASE 

100 PACK 

100 PACK 

10 PACK 

7500 PACK 

EA 

EA 

100 BOX 

12 CT 

3 PACK 

1000 BOX 

100 BOX 

1000 BOX 

120 PACK 

500 CT 

500 CASE 

EA 

EA 

24 BOX 

1000 PACK 

1000 BOX 

42 CT 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

1 BOX 

12 BOX 

64.99 

9.8 

17.02 

29.99 10 RMS/CA 

25.49 

25.49 

44.1 

48.79 

1.83 

0.97 

1.49 

43.88 

3.72 

28.51 

28.17 

19.56 

3.43 

74.14 

26.81 

16.52 48 OZ 

10.1 30.5 OZ 

12.79 

6.69 

6.6 

36.09 

7.74 

5.39 

0.58 

1.46



0.018 

0.012 

0.21 

0.11 

0.67 

NO BID 

0.03 

0.01 

0.008 

7.97 

6.36 

0.0001 

0.0005 

NO BID 

2.52 

0.76 

0.08 

0.36 

0.09 

0.09 

0.18 

0.36 

0.19 

0.19 

0.17 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

429415 

909309 

420994 

442306 

723824 

550657 

189662 

3875302 

766967 

965232 

262620 

728919 

738636 

507055 

128844 

128844 

5670068 

12 BOX 

12 BOX 

18 PACK 

12 PACK 

8 PACK 

2 PACK 

100 PACK 

EA 

1 BOX 

12 PACK 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

36 BOX 

0.25 

0.24 

5.61 

1.53 

9.48 

7.99 

1.27 

7.95 

2.62 

9.35 

17.49 

0.9 

6.99 

17.99 

2.54 

2.54 

18.39 

5000



OD PRICE PER ITEM 

79.99 

NO BID 

0.78 

1.52 

1.46 

NO BID 

3.23 

5.97 

5.97 

2.05 

2.64 

7.13 

7.13 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

3.19 

NO BID 

92.64 

135.49 

NO BID 

76.99 

155.39 

118.99 

174.29 

182.69 

174.29 

4.11 

4.11 

0.07 

0.03 

0.02 

NO BID 

0.19 

0.19 

0.25 

NO BID 

NO BID 

OE ITEM # QTY 

APW-BE 650G1 

TRP-ECO1500LCD 

DUR-MN1500B4Z 

DUR-MN2400B4Z 

UNV-20962 

UNV-20997 

UNV-20746 

UNV-20992 

UNV-31401 

UNV-20972 

UNV-20981 

IVR-15927 

VCT-26402 

RED-C1731 

AAG-70950G05 

AAG-PM428 

ABF-TC1182 

ALE-AEMA2B 

MMM-PF230W9B 

IVR-BLF170 

MMM-PF181C4B 

IVR-BLF185W 

IVR-BLF190 

IVR-BLF190W 

IVR-BLF2OW 

IVR-BLF201 

IVR-BLF201W 

PDC-1060325 

PDC-105870 

UNV-35264 

UNV-36003 

UNV-36320 

QUA-43563 

UNV-14115 

UNV-14215 

UNV-14215 

ACC 70011 

EA 

2 PACK 

6 PACK 

100 BOX 

500 BOX 

500 BOX 

100 BOX 

25 BOX 

25 BOX 

25 BOX 

100 BOX 

UNIT PRICE 

74.68 

212.79 

4.18 

4.28 

1.54 

11.79 

2.99 

3.59 

1.52 

2.26 

2.77 

5.32 

72.05 

2.1 

17.07 

13.98 

7.39 

105.99 

107.3 

42.11 

83.74 

53.54 

53.54 

54.99 

60.16 

50.78 

50.78 

8.81 

26.16 

7.99 

20.99 

9.99 

24.06 

5.59 

6.69 

6.69 

8.76



NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

0.34/02 

NO BID 

NO BID 

2.6 

0.1 

0.09 

2.99 

0.25 

0.25 

4.41 

0.0066 

1.83 

0.97 

0.01 

3.66 

1.24 

0.03 

0.28 

0.02 

0.03 

0.15 

0.05 

0.33 

0.53 

0.007 

0.007 

0.86 

0.65 

0.45 

0.58 

0.12 

SMD-73224 

SMD-74224 

UNV-10506 

UNV-10506 

SMD-16943 

UNV-21125 

OEI-SMP8511 

UNV-24200 

VER-94554 

GBC-3200716 

VER-99810 

UNV-80120 

UNV-80108 

AVE-8366 

UNV-80001 

QUA-46020 

GOJ 363912EA 

UNV-20013 

GEN-FACIAL30100 

CLO-01594EA 

BWK-6272 

MMEF-200045110 

DXE-KH207 

DXE-FH207 

DXE-SH207 

AJM-PP9GREWHPK 

DXE-5342DX 

DXE-9542500DX 

FOL-0529C 

FOL-20421EA 

GMT-0845 

MLA-75413 

RPP-R810BX 

OFX 00021 

SMU-76014 

FOL-06897 

UNV-96920PK 

UNV-20630 

UNV-10210 

UNV-10220 

25 BOX 

25 BOX 

100 BOX 

100 BOX 

100 BOX 

100 BOX 

1 CASE 

1 CASE 

100 PACK 

100 BOX 

5 PACK 

7500 BOX 

600 BOX 

750 PACK 

8000 BOX 

25 CT 

EA 

EA 

30 PACK 

CT 

30 CT 

EA 

100 BOX 

100 BOX 

100 BOX 

100 PACK 

500 CT 

50 PACK 

EA 

EA 

24 BOX 

18 BOX 

1000 BOX 

1200 CT 

200 BOX 

42 CT 

6 PACK 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

23.29 

30.24 

12 

12 

26.5 

3.59 

30.99 

48.99 

11.99 

51.35 

24.65 

19.384 

7.32 

15.02 

8.86 

102.4 

5.99 

0.79 

19.49 

3.99 

21.59 

2.61 

4.39 

4.39 

4.39 

3.29 

55.99 

3.29 

15.99 

10.99 

14.29 

5.99 

0.99 

12.99 

15.29 

19.49 

3.99 

8.29 

0.5 

1.35



NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

0.02 

0.02 

0.31 

0.13 

1.19 

3.99 

0.01 

7.95 

0.0005 

0.78 

1.46 

0.08 

0.58 

1.5 

0.21 

0.21 

0.51 

UNV-10200 

UNV-10199 

UNV-35668 

UNV-28062 

UNV-35673 

UNV-35662 

UNV-99005 

OXF-51 

UNV-47230 

USS-E4754 

USS-T2754 

UNV-79000 

SWI-35550 

UNV-83436VP 

UNV-75612 

PIL 31020 

UNV-15613 

PIL-35349 

UNV-27410 

UNV-27411 

UNV-39510 

PIL-35352 

UNV-08861 

UNV-08860 

UNV-08850 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 PACK 

12 PACK 

12 PACK 

12 PACK 

100 PACK 

100 PACK 

100 PACK 

EA 

EA 

5000 BOX 

2500 BOX 

12 PACK 

10 PACK 

12 DZ 

60 PACK 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

5 SET 

5 SET 

0.25 

0.19 

2.29 

2.19 

6.99 

1.61 

1.99 

1.78 

0.79 

15.99 

4.99 

0.55 

4.58 

6.99 

10.99 

11.39 

4.26 

11.7 

0.79 

0.79 

3.6 

11.7 

3.75 

2.08 

1.85



OE PRICE PER ITEM 

74.68 

212.79 

1.05 

1.07 

1.54 

11.79 

2.99 

3.59 

1.52 

2.26 

2.77 

5.32 

72.05 

2.1 

17.07 

13.98 

7.39 

105.99 

107.3 

42.11 

83.74 

53.54 

53.54 

54.99 

60.16 

50.78 

50.78 

4.4 

4.36 

0.08 

0.04 

0.02 

0.24 

0.22 

0.27 

0.27 

0.09 

AE ITEM # 

TRPOMN1650LCD 

TRPECO1500LCD 

EVEE91LP16 

EVEE92LP16 

OFD396291 

BSN62473 

OFD486328 

OFD486368 

OFD471844 

OFD396251 

OFD396231 

VCT15606 

CNMP23DHV3 

AAGSW20000 

BLS100004 

AAGPM428 

ABFTC1182 

FEL8042901 

MMMPF230W9B 

MMMPF170C4B 

MMMPF181C4B 

MMMPF185W9B 

MMMPF190C4B 

MMMPF190W1B 

MMMPF200W9B 

MMMPF201C3B 

MMMPF201WB 

OFD110284 

FALDEQ7521 

OFD330808 

OFD633904 

OFD63388 

OFD683244 

OFD810994 

SMD65001 

NO BID 

NO BID 

O1C99858 

16 PACK 

16 PACK 

6 PACK 

100 BOX 

500 BOX 

500 BOX 

100 BOX 

25 BOX 

25 BOX 

100 BOX



0.33/0Z 

0.36/0Z 

0.93 

1.21 

0.12 

0.12 

0.27 

0.04 

3.1 

4.9 

0.12 

0.51 

4.93 

0.003 

0.01 

0.02 

0.001 

4.1 

5.99 

0.79 

0.65 

3.99 

0.72 

2.61 

0.04 

0.04 

0.04 

0.03 

0.11 

0.07 

0.6 

0.33 

0.001 

0.01 

0.08 

0.46 

0.67 

0.69 

0.04 

0.11 

SMD73224 

SMD74224 

BSN16517 

OFD542263 

NO BID 

BSN32356 

ADMCP8511 

BSN36593 

VER94554 

BSN20855 

VER99123 

OFD612011 

OFD612061 

AVE15695 

BSN26108 

QUA46020 

GOJ363912 

OFD346437 

SOL11513 

ADM980070881 

PGC74844 

SPR16014 

BWKKNIFEHWPPWH 

BWKFORKHWPPWH 

GJO30402 

GJO10320 

GJO19047CT 

GJO11259CT 

FOL20421 

FOLOO374EA 

GMT6520 

GMT7522 

GJO20050 

SUG72101 

FOL/6014 

FOLO6239 

BSN26740PK 

OFD305466 

BSN36551 

BSN36552 

25 BOX 

25 BOX 

50 BOX 

100 BOX 

50 PACK 

CT 

CT 

100 PACK 

50 BOX 

4 PACK 

3000 CT 

600 CT 

600 PACK 

8000 PACK 

25 CT 

EA 

EA 

30 CT 

5 PACK 

15 CT 

3 PACK 

1000 CT 

1000 CT 

1000 CT 

125 PACK 

1000 CT 

1000 CT 

EA 

EA 

24 BOX 

24 BOX 

1000 BOX 

2000 BOX 

200 BOX 

40 CS 

12 PACK 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ



0.02 

0.02 

0.19 

0.18 

0.58 

0.13 

0.02 

0.02 

0.008 

15.99 

4.99 

0.0001 

0.002 

0.58 

1.1 

0.95 

0.07 

0.98 

0.07 

0.07 

0.3 

0.98 

0.31 

0.42 

0.37 

OFD560394 

BSN65364 

OFD843787 

OFD442306 

BSN36619 

BSN21459 

MMM680SH12 

BSN65263BX 

BSN65261BX 

USSE4850L 

XST40150 

OFD432255 

SWI135465 

BSN43571BX 

ITA60233 

ITA30035 

OFD7/28919 

ITA30036 

OFD7/28919 

OFD7/28982 

ITA36193 

ITA36159 

ITA30004 

ITA30001 

ITA36180 

36 PACK 

12 DZ 

12 PACK 

12 PACK 

5 PACK 

12 PACK 

600 BOX 

500 BOX 

1000 BOX 

EA 

EA 

5000 PACK 

5000 BOX 

12 BOX 

10 PACK 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

12 DZ 

6 ST 

5 ST



UNIT PRICE 

163.54 

240.55 

24.1 

24.1 

1.3 

9.73 

2.31 

2.87 

1.27 

1.66 

1.98 

175.8 

37.94 

9.74 

11.36 

16.58 

7.61 

114.83 

127.35 

86.67 

103.31 

87.76 

92.3 

98.36 

128.63 

176.35 

95.74 

12.82 

7.86 

7.58 

11.16 

8.97 

9.31 

3.95 

22.78 

9.88 

NO BID 

NO BID 

AE PRICE PER ITEM 

163.54 

240.55 

1.51 

1.51 

1.3 

9.73 

2.31 

2.87 

1.27 

1.66 

1.98 

175.8 

37.94 

9.74 

11.36 

16.58 

7.61 

114.83 

127.35 

86.67 

103.31 

87.76 

92.3 

98.36 

128.63 

176.35 

95.74 

2.14 

7.86 

0.08 

0.02 

0.02 

0.09 

0.16 

0.91 

0.1



41.86 

48.15 

20.97 

10.25 

3.36 

29.99 

36.99 

23.88 

8.97 

23.9 

4.32 

4.42 

13.64 

10.66 

158.56 

5.9 

0.72 

21.35 

16.4 

30.18 

2.11 

20.06 

20.06 

17.02 

12.18 

57.78 

39.15 

12.92 30.5 OZ 

12.41 22.6 OZ 

12.93 

13.58 

1.78 

21.69 

20.64 

25.57 

17.67 

5.81 

0.62 

1.73 

NO BID
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26 March 2020 

Attn: 

Admiral Express, LLC Office Depot, Inc. 

1823 N. Yellow Ave 6600 N Military Trail 

Broken Arrow, OK 74012 Boca Raton, FL 33496 

Office Essentials Quill, LLC 

1834 Walton Rd. 100 Shelter Rd. 

St. Louis, MO 63114 Lincolnshire, IL 60069 

The Christian County Commission voted in session today to award the bid for 

office supplies to all vendors. We thank you for participating in the bidding 

process and we look forward to working with you. 

Thank you, 

a 
A ge epee on Co 

“ 

Hosea Bilyeu Ralph Philli Mike Robertson 

Western Commissioner Presiding Commissioner Eastern Commissioner 

Website: www.christiancountymo.gov Email: countycommission@christiancountymo.gov 

© Printed on Recycled Paper



RALPH PHILLIPS 

Christian County Presiding Commissioner 

100 West Church St., Room 100 

Ozark, Missouri 65721 

rphillips @christiancountymo.gov 

March 26, 2020 

For Immediate Release 

Christian County to Remain Open but with Offices Closing to the Public 

OZARK, Missouri - In response to the ongoing Coronavirus (COVID-19) pandemic the Christian County 

Commission announced today that Christian County offices will be closed to the public beginning Monday 

March 30, 2020. During this period, the various office holders and their respective staff will continue to 

perform their basic functions to the degree possible with public interaction limited to telephone and email. 

This action applies to the Historic Courthouse, Resource Management Building, Recycling Center and Road 

Barns. 

In the meetings leading up to this decision, Danny Gray, the Christian County Assessor said “Tt’s important 

for people to understand that we are still open for business, but right now we just have to conduct that 

business through telephone, email and fax.” 

This policy is intended to correspond to the County’s Stay at Home Order and will remain in effect for the 

duration of that Order unless the measure 1s withdrawn or removed by the County Commission. 

Presiding Circuit Judge Laura Johnson made a similar announcement with regard to the judicial buildings 

saying the Circuit Court of Christian County is temporarily closed to the general public but will continue 

to process cases and to accept both paper and electronic filings. Any questions should be directed to the 

Circuit Clerk's office. 

For additional information regarding the availability of services for specific offices, please visit 

www.christiancountymo.gov where the County will place an easy to find list of contact information for 

each office. 

HHH 

Media Contact: 

Todd Wiesehan 

Resource Management Director 

(Serving as PIO for the Christian County Commission) 

(417) 581-7242 | toddwiesehan @christiancountymo.gov 
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